
Received 10/27/2020 - 7:59am

Location
 Weekly Mowing  Hedge/Tree Trimming  Mulch per yard 

 Mulch Cost per 

Property 

 Flower/Flower 

Pots 

 Spring Clean 

Up 

 Fall Clean 

Up  

555 Windsor Street 210.00$                       600.00$                                   58.5 yard 320.00$                     700.00$              1,025.00$    

565 Windsor Street 80.00$                         60.00$                                     N/A N/A 120.00$               150.00$       

711 Garden Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

170 Douglas Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

211 Laurel Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

395 Wethersfield Ave No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Stonington Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32-38 Wethersfield Ave No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1443 Main Street 60.00$                         30.00$                                     N/A N/A 125.00$               180.00$       

1921 Park Street No Bid No Bid N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid

35 Clark Street (including Barbour/Capen) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

330 Market Street 70.00$                         200.00$                                   58.5 yard 160.00$              200.00$      

385 Main Street, EH 80.00$                         150.00$                                    N/A N/A 200.00$              250.00$      

22 Colt Street, EH 45.00$                         40.00$                                     58.5 yard 80.00$                125.00$       

44 Hamlin Street, Middletown No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Received 10/27/2020 - 9:20am

Location
 Weekly Mowing  Hedge/Tree Trimming  Mulch per yard 

 Mulch Cost per 

Property 

 Flower/Flower 

Pots 

 Spring Clean 

Up 

 Fall Clean 

Up  

555 Windsor Street 130.00$                       390.00$                                   525.00$                    300.00$                     290.00$              390.00$      

565 Windsor Street 65.00$                         -$                                          N/A N/A N/A 100.00$              100.00$       

711 Garden Street 65.00$                         130.00$                                    225.00$                    N/A 130.00$               195.00$       

170 Douglas Street 65.00$                         260.00$                                   750.00$                    N/A 200.00$              300.00$      

211 Laurel Street 90.00$                         130.00$                                    150.00$                    N/A 130.00$               130.00$       

395 Wethersfield Ave 50.00$                         65.00$                                     150.00$                    N/A 65.00$                130.00$       

8 Stonington Street 50.00$                         65.00$                                     250.00$                    N/A 65.00$                130.00$       

32-38 Wethersfield Ave 65.00$                         175.00$                                    200.00$                   N/A 130.00$               260.00$      

1443 Main Street 65.00$                         65.00$                                     N/A N/A N/A 65.00$                130.00$       

1921 Park Street 50.00$                         50.00$                                     N/A N/A N/A 130.00$               195.00$       

35 Clark Street (including Barbour/Capen) 195.00$                       260.00$                                   750.00$                    N/A 290.00$              390.00$      

330 Market Street 50.00$                         260.00$                                   300.00$                   N/A 130.00$               195.00$       

385 Main Street, EH 50.00$                         190.00$                                    N/A N/A N/A 100.00$              130.00$       

22 Colt Street, EH 50.00$                         75.00$                                      75.00$                      N/A 65.00$                95.00$        

44 Hamlin Street, Middletown 95.00$                         225.00$                                    375.00$                    N/A 160.00$              225.00$       

RFQ Landscaping Services Results

Alricks Landscaping, LLC 2020 -2021

Greenway Property Services, Inc.   2020 -2021



Received 10/27/2020 - 8:52am

Location
 Weekly Mowing  Hedge/Tree Trimming  Mulch per yard 

 Mulch Cost per 

Property 

 Flower/Flower 

Pots 

 Spring Clean 

Up 

 Fall Clean 

Up  

555 Windsor Street 110.00$                        180.00$                                    67 yard 660.00$                   640.00$                     246.50$              185.00$       

565 Windsor Street 30.00$                         25.00$                                      N/A N/A N/A 60.00$                60.00$        

711 Garden Street 35.00$                         25.00$                                      67 yard 175.00$                    N/A 87.50$                 75.00$         

170 Douglas Street 31.50$                          72.00$                                      67 yard 1,475.00$                 N/A 210.00$               87.50$         

211 Laurel Street 77.50$                          50.00$                                     67 yard 45.00$                      N/A 130.00$               165.00$       

395 Wethersfield Ave 30.00$                         85.00$                                     67 yard 75.00$                      N/A 150.00$               110.00$       

8 Stonington Street 33.00$                         75.00$                                      67 yard 225.00$                    N/A 58.00$                64.00$        

32-38 Wethersfield Ave 45.00$                         75.00$                                      67 yard 185.00$                    N/A 195.00$               136.00$       

1443 Main Street 31.00$                          10.00$                                      N/A N/A N/A 87.50$                 75.00$         

1921 Park Street 44.00$                         75.00$                                      N/A N/A N/A 87.50$                 95.00$        

35 Clark Street (including Barbour/Capen) 161.00$                        93.00$                                     67 yard 300.00$                   N/A 410.00$              280.00$      

330 Market Street 47.50$                         90.00$                                     67 yard 175.00$                    N/A 125.00$               95.00$        

385 Main Street, EH 55.00$                         250.00$                                   N/A N/A N/A 150.00$               160.00$       

22 Colt Street, EH 34.00$                         70.00$                                      67 yard 95.00$                      N/A 175.00$               125.00$       

44 Hamlin Street, Middletown 260.00$                       325.00$                                    67 yard 460.00$                   N/A 450.00$              475.00$      

Received 10/26/2020 - 3:05pm

Location
 Weekly Mowing  Hedge/Tree Trimming  Mulch per yard 

 Mulch Cost per 

Property 

 Flower/Flower 

Pots 

 Spring Clean 

Up 

 Fall Clean 

Up  

555 Windsor Street 165.00$                       495.00$                                   85 yard 475.00$                    380.00$                     440.00$             440.00$      

565 Windsor Street 55.00$                         N/A N/A N/A N/A 110.00$               110.00$       

711 Garden Street 83.00$                         165.00$                                    85 yard 285.00$                    N/A 185.00$               185.00$       

170 Douglas Street 83.00$                         165.00$                                    85 yard 380.00$                   N/A 250.00$              250.00$      

211 Laurel Street 55.00$                         165.00$                                    85 yard 190.00$                    N/A 330.00$              330.00$      

395 Wethersfield Ave 50.00$                         55.00$                                      85 yard did not provide N/A 110.00$               110.00$       

8 Stonington Street 55.00$                         N/A 85 yard 380.00$                   N/A 165.00$               165.00$       

32-38 Wethersfield Ave 42.00$                         220.00$                                   85 yard 275.00$                    N/A 330.00$              330.00$      

1443 Main Street 55.00$                         N/A N/A N/A N/A 165.00$               225.00$       

1921 Park Street 55.00$                         220.00$                                   N/A N/A N/A 275.00$              275.00$       

35 Clark Street (including Barbour/Capen) 83.00$                         140.00$                                    85 yard 285.00$                    N/A 250.00$              330.00$      

330 Market Street 83.00$                         225.00$                                    85 yard 350.00$                   N/A 220.00$              320.00$      

385 Main Street, EH 83.00$                         275.00$                                    N/A N/A N/A 330.00$              330.00$      

22 Colt Street, EH 50.00$                         55.00$                                      85 yard 95.00$                      N/A 220.00$              220.00$      

44 Hamlin Street, Middletown 165.00$                       220.00$                                   85 yard 380.00$                   N/A 330.00$              600.00$      

T&T Complete Landscaping, LLC   2020 -2021

Diamond Landscaping & Athletic Fields, Inc.  2020 -2021



Received 10/27/2020 - 9:53am

Location
 Weekly Mowing  Hedge/Tree Trimming  Mulch per yard 

 Mulch Cost per 

Property 

 Flower/Flower 

Pots 

 Spring Clean 

Up 

 Fall Clean 

Up  

555 Windsor Street 115.00$                        500.00$                                   70 yard 700.00$                   350.00$                     400.00$             450.00$      

565 Windsor Street 55.00$                         200.00$                                   N/A N/A N/A 250.00$              350.00$      

711 Garden Street 75.00$                         200.00$                                   70 yard 280.00$                   N/A 250.00$              350.00$      

170 Douglas Street 50.00$                         325.00$                                    70 yard 840.00$                   N/A 350.00$              375.00$       

211 Laurel Street 80.00$                         325.00$                                    70 yard 350.00$                   N/A 300.00$              400.00$      

395 Wethersfield Ave 50.00$                         150.00$                                    70 yard 210.00$                    N/A 225.00$              325.00$       

8 Stonington Street 75.00$                         250.00$                                   70 yard 350.00$                   N/A 350.00$              400.00$      

32-38 Wethersfield Ave 85.00$                         375.00$                                    70 yard 350.00$                   N/A 350.00$              500.00$      

1443 Main Street 70.00$                         250.00$                                   N/A N/A N/A 275.00$              325.00$       

1921 Park Street 70.00$                         225.00$                                    N/A N/A N/A 250.00$              300.00$      

35 Clark Street (including Barbour/Capen) 80.00$                         275.00$                                    70 yard 560.00$                   N/A 300.00$              350.00$      

330 Market Street 70.00$                         225.00$                                    70 yard 420.00$                   N/A 250.00$              400.00$      

385 Main Street, EH 100.00$                       225.00$                                    N/A N/A N/A 300.00$              375.00$       

22 Colt Street, EH 65.00$                         150.00$                                    70 yard 210.00$                    N/A 250.00$              350.00$      

44 Hamlin Street, Middletown 85.00$                         375.00$                                    70 yard 700.00$                   N/A 350.00$              400.00$      

Summary Totals All Properties Weekly Mowing Hedge/Tree Trimming Mulch per Yard Flower Pots Spring Clean Up Fall Clean Up

T&T Landscaping 1,024.50$                    1,500.00$                                67 yard 640.00$                   2,622.00$                  2,187.50$            

Diamond Landscaping 1,162.00$                     2,400.00$                               85 yard 380.00$                   3,710.00$                  4,220.00$           

Cutting Edge Landscaping 1,125.00$                     4,050.00$                               70 yard 350.00$                   4,450.00$                 5,650.00$          

Cutting Edge Landscaping   2020 -2021



Did not submit 2021 -2022 pricing  - Bid Incomplete

Location
 Weekly Mowing  Hedge/Tree Trimming  Mulch per yard 

 Mulch Cost per 

Property 

 Flower/Flower 

Pots 

 Spring Clean 

Up 

 Fall Clean 

Up  

555 Windsor Street

565 Windsor Street

711 Garden Street

170 Douglas Street

211 Laurel Street

395 Wethersfield Ave

8 Stonington Street

32-38 Wethersfield Ave

1443 Main Street

1921 Park Street

35 Clark Street (including Barbour/Capen)

330 Market Street

385 Main Street, EH

22 Colt Street, EH

44 Hamlin Street, Middletown

Did not submit 2021 -2022 pricing  - Bid Incomplete

Location
 Weekly Mowing  Hedge/Tree Trimming  Mulch per yard 

 Mulch Cost per 

Property 

 Flower/Flower 

Pots 

 Spring Clean 

Up 

 Fall Clean 

Up  

555 Windsor Street

565 Windsor Street

711 Garden Street

170 Douglas Street

211 Laurel Street

395 Wethersfield Ave

8 Stonington Street

32-38 Wethersfield Ave

1443 Main Street

1921 Park Street

35 Clark Street (including Barbour/Capen)

330 Market Street

385 Main Street, EH

22 Colt Street, EH

44 Hamlin Street, Middletown

Alricks Landscaping, LLC 2021 -2022

Greenway Property Services, Inc. 2021 - 2022



Received 10/27/2020 - 8:52am

Location
 Weekly Mowing  Hedge/Tree Trimming  Mulch per yard 

 Mulch Cost per 

Property 

 Flower/Flower 

Pots 

 Spring Clean 

Up 

 Fall Clean 

Up  

555 Windsor Street 110.00$                        180.00$                                    67 yard 660.00$                   640.00$                     246.50$              185.00$       

565 Windsor Street 30.00$                         25.00$                                      N/A N/A N/A 60.00$                60.00$        

711 Garden Street 35.00$                         25.00$                                      67 yard 175.00$                    N/A 87.50$                 75.00$         

170 Douglas Street 31.50$                          75.00$                                      67 yard 1,600.00$                N/A 210.00$               87.50$         

211 Laurel Street 77.50$                          50.00$                                     67 yard 45.00$                      N/A 130.00$               165.00$       

395 Wethersfield Ave 30.00$                         85.00$                                     67 yard 75.00$                      N/A 150.00$               110.00$       

8 Stonington Street 33.00$                         75.00$                                      67 yard 225.00$                    N/A 58.00$                64.00$        

32-38 Wethersfield Ave 45.00$                         75.00$                                      67 yard 185.00$                    N/A 195.00$               136.00$       

1443 Main Street 31.00$                          10.00$                                      N/A N/A N/A 87.50$                 75.00$         

1921 Park Street 44.00$                         75.00$                                      N/A N/A N/A 87.50$                 95.00$        

35 Clark Street (including Barbour/Capen) 161.00$                        93.00$                                     67 yard 300.00$                   N/A 410.00$              280.00$      

330 Market Street 47.50$                         90.00$                                     67 yard 175.00$                    N/A 125.00$               95.00$        

385 Main Street, EH 55.00$                         250.00$                                   N/A N/A N/A 150.00$               160.00$       

22 Colt Street, EH 34.00$                         70.00$                                      67 yard 95.00$                      N/A 175.00$               125.00$       

44 Hamlin Street, Middletown 260.00$                       325.00$                                    67 yard 460.00$                   N/A 450.00$              475.00$      

Received 10/26/2020 - 3:05pm

Location
 Weekly Mowing  Hedge/Tree Trimming  Mulch per yard 

 Mulch Cost per 

Property 

 Flower/Flower 

Pots 

 Spring Clean 

Up 

 Fall Clean 

Up  

555 Windsor Street 170.00$                       505.00$                                   85 yard 485.00$                   390.00$                     450.00$              450.00$      

565 Windsor Street 58.00$                         N/A N/A N/A N/A 115.00$               115.00$        

711 Garden Street 85.00$                         170.00$                                    85 yard 292.00$                    N/A 190.00$              190.00$       

170 Douglas Street 85.00$                         170.00$                                    85 yard 390.00$                   N/A 256.00$              256.00$      

211 Laurel Street 58.00$                         170.00$                                    85 yard 195.00$                    N/A 340.00$              340.00$      

395 Wethersfield Ave 52.00$                         58.00$                                     85 yard did not provide N/A 115.00$               115.00$        

8 Stonington Street 58.00$                         N/A 85 yard 390.00$                   N/A 170.00$               170.00$       

32-38 Wethersfield Ave 43.00$                         225.00$                                    85 yard 281.00$                    N/A 340.00$              340.00$      

1443 Main Street 58.00$                         N/A N/A N/A N/A 170.00$               230.00$      

1921 Park Street 58.00$                         225.00$                                    N/A N/A N/A 280.00$              280.00$      

35 Clark Street (including Barbour/Capen) 85.00$                         145.00$                                    85 yard 292.00$                    N/A 255.00$              340.00$      

330 Market Street 85.00$                         230.00$                                   85 yard 360.00$                   N/A 225.00$              320.00$      

385 Main Street, EH 85.00$                         280.00$                                   N/A N/A N/A 340.00$              340.00$      

22 Colt Street, EH 52.00$                         58.00$                                     85 yard 98.00$                     N/A 225.00$              225.00$       

44 Hamlin Street, Middletown 170.00$                       225.00$                                    85 yard 390.00$                   N/A 340.00$              615.00$       

T&T Complete Landscaping, LLC 2021 - 2022

Diamond Landscaping & Athletic Fields, Inc.  2021 - 2022



Received 10/27/2020 - 9:53am

Location
 Weekly Mowing  Hedge/Tree Trimming  Mulch per yard 

 Mulch Cost per 

Property 

 Flower/Flower 

Pots 

 Spring Clean 

Up 

 Fall Clean 

Up  

555 Windsor Street 115.00$                        500.00$                                   70 yard 700.00$                   350.00$                     400.00$             450.00$      

565 Windsor Street 55.00$                         200.00$                                   N/A N/A N/A 250.00$              350.00$      

711 Garden Street 75.00$                         200.00$                                   70 yard 280.00$                   N/A 250.00$              350.00$      

170 Douglas Street 50.00$                         325.00$                                    70 yard 840.00$                   N/A 350.00$              375.00$       

211 Laurel Street 80.00$                         325.00$                                    70 yard 350.00$                   N/A 300.00$              400.00$      

395 Wethersfield Ave 50.00$                         150.00$                                    70 yard 210.00$                    N/A 225.00$              325.00$       

8 Stonington Street 75.00$                         250.00$                                   70 yard 350.00$                   N/A 350.00$              400.00$      

32-38 Wethersfield Ave 85.00$                         375.00$                                    70 yard 350.00$                   N/A 350.00$              500.00$      

1443 Main Street 70.00$                         250.00$                                   N/A N/A N/A 275.00$              325.00$       

1921 Park Street 70.00$                         225.00$                                    N/A N/A N/A 250.00$              300.00$      

35 Clark Street (including Barbour/Capen) 80.00$                         275.00$                                    70 yard 560.00$                   N/A 300.00$              350.00$      

330 Market Street 70.00$                         225.00$                                    70 yard 420.00$                   N/A 250.00$              400.00$      

385 Main Street, EH 100.00$                       225.00$                                    N/A N/A N/A 300.00$              375.00$       

22 Colt Street, EH 65.00$                         150.00$                                    70 yard 210.00$                    N/A 250.00$              350.00$      

44 Hamlin Street, Middletown 85.00$                         375.00$                                    70 yard 700.00$                   N/A 350.00$              400.00$      

Cutting Edge Landscaping 2021 - 2022


